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Fall in love at Bayside, where sandy beaches, good friends, and true love come together in the sweet small
towns of Cape Cod. Bayside Summers is a series of standalone romance novels featuring fiercely loyal
heroes and sassy, empowered women. They're fun, flirty, flawed, and easy to relate to.

In Sweet Love at Bayside…
As the co-owner of Bayside Resorts, Rick Savage has a fabulous job working with his best friends and
brother, and a thriving business in Washington, DC, which he'll be returning to at the end of the summer.
Spending time with his family is great, but being back on Cape Cod has unearthed painful memories. When
sweet, smart, and overly cautious Desiree Cleary moves in next door, Rick is drawn to the sexy preschool
teacher, and she just might prove to be the perfect distraction.

Running an art gallery was not in preschool teacher Desiree Cleary's plans, but after being tricked into
coming to her impetuous, unreliable mother's aid, she's stuck spending the summer with the rebellious half
sister she barely knows and a misbehaving dog. If that's not frustrating enough, she can't escape the sparks
igniting with her strikingly handsome and pushy neighbor, Rick, who makes all her warning bells go off.

Passion ignites as Desiree and Rick spend long summer nights sharing heartfelt confessions and steamy
kisses. For the first time in years Rick is enjoying life again instead of hiding behind mounds of work miles
away from his family. Desiree has touched him in a way that makes him want to slow down. Only slowing
down means dealing with his demons, and he isn't sure who he'll be when he comes out the other side.

Sweet Love at Bayside is a Sweet with Heat novel and conveys all of the passion you'd expect to find
between two people in love without any graphic scenes or harsh language. If you're looking for a spicier
romance, pick up the steamy edition, Bayside Desires, written by New York Times bestselling author Melissa
Foster. Addison Cole is Melissa's sweet-romance pen name.
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From Reader Review Sweet Love at Bayside for online ebook

Sonya Neal says

Desiree has spent her life with seriously mixed feelings about her mother, and receiving word that she
needed to come to the Cape to save her mother's life was her last straw. Desiree drops everything to rush to
her mother's aid, and winds up stuck running her mother's gallery and overseeing construction for the
summer.

Rick is a workaholic who has taken a break to work at his family's resort for a short time, when his life is
constantly disrupted by a dog in the resort pool. As he searches for the owner he bumps into Desiree again,
and they soon begin an amazing relationship.

But it can only be a summer romance, since both Desiree and Rick have to go back to work. Can they make
it work?

This book is lovely and romantic and made me laugh! Even though Desiree's mother is flighty and
sometimes hurtful her antics (and the antics of Cosmos the dog) were hilarious!

I have volunteered to share my review and all the opinions are 100% my own.

Fee (Ebook Addicts) says

When Desiree turns up at Bayside worried about her mother little did she think she would have no need to
worry let alone fall in love and up-root her life. Summoned to Bayside under false pretences, Desiree’s
mother led her to believe that she was at deaths door but instead she just needs her and her sister violet to
come look after her house/studio whilst she goes goes off to “find herself”

When Rick Savage first meets Desiree there is no denying the instant attraction between them, but both of
them know that they are only in the Cape for the summer, so they make it a fling to remember. I really loved
how Rick brought out the naughty side to Desiree and loved watching her grow from this innocent school
teacher to vixen. Can they make it more than a summer fling to remember and make it a lifetime of romance?

Addison has turned one hot story into a sinfully sweet version that you will just love.

Lisa Dryden says

Brilliant read, loved the feel good feeling to this book.

Loved all the characters and cannot wait for Violets book!!!

OMG Rick is so caring and romantic and what he does for Desiree at thee end of the book will have your
heart melting, literally!!



A great book to read anytime of the year but this is also a great book to read whilst lying around a pool in the
sun or lying on a beach.

Another friends to lovers book on its way but will let you read to find out who. I love those kind of romance
novels so very excited to read it.

Another great book by a brilliant author!!!

Jessie Chick says

Rick is taking a break from his workaholic life and keeps running into the lovely Desiree. Their attraction is
undeniably adorable and I loved watching their story unfold. I mean who knew coming home would help
them both find love. Addison Cole does an amazing job of making you feel like part of the story. In this love
story, you feel like you're a bystander watching these two have the best fling of the summer. 

If this is book one, I can't wait for the rest of this series! Addison Cole is definitely my top favorite author
and I can't wait to see where she takes this series! 

Ana Paula says

Addison Cole is the sweet side of the Melissa Foster.
I have been reading her books for years and I am always surprised by her stories and how the characters are
so well constructed and are so three dimensional.
Here we have a kind of spin off of the Seaside series and now we get to meet the Bayside characters family,
they are the Savage family and their friends.
Rick Savage is an interesting character, he is sensitive and has a heart of gold, but the death of his father has
influenced the adult he is now. Desiree is an extremely sweet girl who has an absent mother and a "crazy"
and "over the top" sister. These two together are like a chocolate marshmallow sundae in the afternoon: too
good to be true.
You will love this series.

loopyloulaura says

I read this and the second book in the wrong order! It actually didn’t matter. This is one of my all time
favourites from Addison Cole.
Desiree is tricked into visiting her mother. I felt such fury at Lizza for being such an unreliable mother to her
daughters and could really identify with Des’ need for order and plans.
I was really hoping for the relationship between Desiree and her sister to become stronger despite the pain of
their childhood separation (I won’t reveal if it does…)
Then we have the romance. It started straight away and there was no angst just the beautiful development of
love. They knew they were meant to be together. Both of them had family sadness: Desiree because of her



mother’s personality and Rick because his father died.
I really loved this book. The romance was just perfect and left me with a warm fuzzy feeling

Shelly says

I am completely unfamiliar with the Cape area yet I feel that I have visited many times and know it like the
back of my hand! Addison's writing opens up the imagination and lets you sink into the every day life with
the characters. This time around, we get to experience Desiree and Rick. Both characters face their own
difficulties regarding family, careers, personal/romantic lives yet somehow, they are drawn to each other.
Desiree’s mother is quite the character, indeed! She is manipulative yet flighty and comes across as a very
selfish, childish woman. However, through that personality and choice of actions, her daughters are brought
together and form a strong bond. Honestly, I think that was my favorite piece of the story – even beyond
Rick and Desiree’s romance! The heat between the pair will make your heart soar and when the relationship
brings everything/one together, you’ll feel comforted that the past is healed. 

I have volunteered to share my review and all the opinions are 100% my own.

Kaitlyn says

Sweet Love at Bayside is an adorable read. The book caught my attention from the start. The way Desiree
and Rick meet is the beginning of a perfect summer romance.

Both characters have a lot on their plate.

Rick owns a company with his two friends. He seems like the person who has it all, but is it enough? His
instant spark with Desiree leaves him wanting more.

Desiree receives an unexpected and cryptic message from her mother. Desiree didn't always have the best
relationship with her mother, yet she still rushes to her mother's aid.

Her mother is right that some things are meant to be and happen for a reason. Desiree has much to learn
about herself, her family, and possibilities for the future.

The story kept my interest, and I can't wait for more.

I received this book as an Advance Reader's Copy. I volunteered to leave a review. All opinions are my own.

Fee (Ebook Addicts) says

Sweet Love at Bayside by Addison Cole When Desiree turns up at Bayside worried about her mother little
did she think she would have no need to worry let alone fall in love and up-root her life. Summoned to
Bayside under false pretences, Desiree’s mother led her to believe that she was at deaths door but instead she
just needs her and her sister violet to come look after her house/studio whilst she goes goes off to “find
herself”



 
When Rick Savage first meets Desiree there is no denying the instant attraction between them, but both of
them know that they are only in the Cape for the summer, so they make it a fling to remember. I really loved
how Rick brought out the naughty side to Desiree and loved watching her grow from this innocent school
teacher to vixen. Can they make it more than a summer fling to remember and make it a lifetime of romance?
Addison has turned one hot story into a sinfully sweet version that you will just love.

Isha Coleman says

The road to fulfillment is not always the one we plan for ourselves. Hearts break, life changes and wiser
heads prevail, but we can take pride in the fact that our choices, though not always right, brought us to where
we were meant to be. Sweet Love at Bayside is one couple's road map to finding home. Rick and Desiree are
both capable people with strong opinions, but their lives have sort of stalled when it comes to happiness. He's
building a business. She's losing herself in responsibilities that are not completely her own. Can two people
with so much love to give, make time to find something special together? Cole makes the complicated
simple with an overflow of wisdom and heart. Realism does not always have to be complicated to find
rewarding.

Silvie Armas says

In this story we meet Rick and Desire who right off the bat you I knew were meant for each other. I have
always been a fan of stories where fate works it magic to bring a couple together. Fate definitely brings these
two together in an great way. Desiree is a great woman who has had to deal with an absent mother and a
super fun sister. Rick Savage is a sensitive man with a big heart, but his father’s death has definitely
influenced the adult he is now. I couldn’t put this book down from the start. This book had me laughing and
wanting more with every page.

Tanya says

This was my favorite Addison Cole book so far! I say that with every new book, but this surpassed all my
expectations. I love the insta-love between Rick and Desiree. Rick was the perfect Hero for me, he knew
what he wanted and never wavered. I love that Rick was able to help Desiree become more comfortable
within herself. Such a beautiful love story that I never wanted to end!

Alexis Bruce says

Desiree and Rick......how swoony can you get....LOVED their story, their love and their wit! What a fantastic
start to the Bayside series and I have already had two new people say they are going to read it!!!! This is
Addison Cole at her finest.



April says

Sweet Love at Bayside by Addison Cole is a fun, flirty, sweet romance with a touch of heart. Well crafted,
easy to read, a bit predictable but totally worth the time to read. A fun beach read with great  but flawed
characters, who are feisty, flirty, fiercely loyal and an interesting and entertaining small  beach town
romance, set in Cape Cod.  Loved everything about SWEET LOVE BAYSIDE. The author did an amazing
job of convening the characters and the story to her readers. A must read beach romance.

"I voluntarily received a complimentary copy, however,  these are my honest opinions. I was in no way
required nor compensated to write a review."

 

Rating: 4.5

Heat rating: sweet 

Reviewer: AprilR 

 

Jennifer says

Desiree is sweet, beautiful, and somewhat reserved when the novel begins, but as she begins re-connecting
with her half-sister Violet, the reader slowly sees a more carefree and adventurous side of Desiree. Rick also
seems somewhat serious at the beginning, as well as, steal dealing with the trauma of losing his father during
a sailing accident years earlier. However, Rick also has a fun and flirty side which only seems to grow
throughout the novel.

My favorite thing about Sweet Love at Bayside was the rekindling of the relationship between Desiree and
Violet. Yes, I realize it should be all about the romance with Rick and Desiree, but I loved watching these
two grow closer and slowly open up about their regrets about their relationship between each other, as well
as, with their mother.

Both Rick and Desiree reached each other in different ways, but their growing relationship sparked a new
outlook on life for each of them, as well as, prompting them both to consider major life changes in order to
find happiness. The beauty of it all was that their choices were not only because of the feelings that
developed between them but because of an overall desire for a better life.

I cannot recommend this series enough to fans of sweet, sexy, contemporary romance. If you are already a
fan of Addison Cole, then I assure you that this first novel in this series will completely hook you. For those
that haven’t read Addison Cole yet, you are missing out on amazing, meaningful, and heartfelt storylines that
are completely addictive, make your heart burst with joy, and just leave you feeling good. Kudos to this
outstanding author for bringing readers another incredible series.

*Thanks to Beck Valley Books and the author for providing this ARC in exchange for my honest review!




