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For the first time in years, Christmas brings hope to Bygones, Kansas. But for Josh Barton, Main Street's
coffee shop owner, it brings back sad memories he'd rather forget. He's a new man, with a new life and faith
now. Still, he hides a huge part of himself from his neighbors—and from one very inquisitive reporter.
Whitney Leigh seems determined to uncover the mystery of the town's recent windfall, and Josh could help
her. But that would mean opening up his guarded heart. Can a man who thought family and Christmas were
only for others find a forever home where he least expects?

The Heart of Main Street: They're rebuilding the town one step—and heart—at a time.
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From Reader Review Cozy Christmas for online ebook

Deanne Patterson says

Determined to discover the source of Bygones, Kansas recent windfall of cash very inquisitive reporter,
Whitney Leigh is on the case. Josh Barton knows Christmas is something he would rather just forget since it
just brings back unhappy childhood memories. His father just used Christmas as a way to further his business
and didn't celebrate it family or church wise. His mother was intimidated by his father so she just went along
with it. Reporter, Whitney needs Josh's help ferreting out this mystery but he doesn't seem to want anything
to do with it. When a reveal is made that hurts Whitney will there be a chance of a reestablished relationship?

Sarah Adamson says

Nice cozy romantic Christmas read. Nice escapism and chance to think about the saving of a small town and
older fashioned ways. Some interesting quirks to the story!

Harlequin Books says

"This neatly wraps up the Heart of Main Street series, finally revealing the secret that readers have been
longing to learn. The charming characters and welcoming spirit suit the holiday season, reminding us that the
'God-incidences' in life, not money, bring true happiness". (RT Book Reviews, rated 4 1/2 stars)

Miniseries: The Heart of Main Street

Dorel says

This is the 2nd book I read by Valerie Hansen. I'm sorry I stopped reading this story at chapter 2 because it
didn't hold my interest.

Jennifer says

I really liked this book. The only reason it didn't receive 4 stars is because there was a lot of talk about the
other romances in the beginning that distracted me from the story. I kept wondering about the other couples
and was confused since I had not read the other books. (Since this author did not write the other books, I
didn't realize that this was the last in a series until the author's note at the end of the book. If I had known up
front this was the last in the series, I might not have felt the same because I would have made exceptions for
it.)

I think this book would have been awesome if I had read the other books in the series first. For the record, I
am adding the other Main Street books to my "to read" list.



amandra says

I thought this series was super cute while maintaining the same story each author was able to add something
special I was surprised to find out who "Mr money bags" was in a good way not what I was expecting at all.

Angel says

I don't read much Christmas book, but I wanted to get in the Christmas spirit. It helped. I liked all the
characters. All nice people. Makes me want to be a resident in Bygones. What a nice Christmas story. This is
the first book (book #6) in the series that I've read. You don't have to start at book #1 to understand.

Brittany says

I won this book in a contest on another blog and when the author sent this book to me, I decided to read it
right away since it is a Christmas book. I have had a lot of fun reading Christmas stories over the holidays
and this is another story that I really enjoyed.

The author has done a wonderful job of creating a sweet, hometown atmosphere and a truly cozy Christmas
(as the title implies). The storyline is clever and the characters are likeable. The heroine of the story,
Whitney, was sometimes a bit pushy, however, that really goes along with her personality and career. She is
a journalist, after all, and intent on uncovering some hidden information in her town.

Josh is the local coffee shop barista, and is very hesitant to have Whitney asking him so many questions and
wanting his help to uncover the mysterious town benefactor. As feelings grow between the two, will
Whitney’s determination to figure out the truth undermine what could be true love?

If you are looking for a sweet Christmas love story, with a twist, you will find it in Cozy Christmas. I am
glad I read it during the holidays, however, I must admit that I will also read holiday stories at other times of
the year, too!

I won this book in a contest on http://iblog4books.blogspot.com/ and received this book from the author. I
was not required to write a review, but happily do so.

You can read this review on my blog at:
http://brittreadsfiction.wordpress.co...

Bonnie says

Cozy Christmas by Valerie Hansen was the last book in "The Heart Of Main Street" series. the six book set
was each by a different author. The books all ran nicely into the next book. Whitney writes for a newspaper.



She is determined to find out who the secret benefactor is, who has brought new businesses to the town. The
person is doing this for their, mom who grew up in the town and found out the town was in need of help.
Whitney finds love in the end. I won't say who the benefactor is. Everyone will have to read the series to find
out. Wonderful series.

Linda says

Cute Christmas romance.

Ruth says

I have read many books by Valerie Hansen but I do believe this is her A-#1 of all time!! I LOVED it and it is
definitely a re-read!!!! The other stories in this series were really good but this one was the best of all! It is
amazing to me, how you can write like this! Definitely a God-given talent! Thanks so much for sharing that
talent with your faithful readers!! May God continue His blessings on you and I eagerly await your next
book.

Aerykah says

This was good, but I'm sure I would have enjoyed it more if I had read the other books in the series first.
Didn't realize it was part of a series until I started reading it...

Teresa says

Such a great story! Loved this series!!!! I hope they will write more since the town will be getting new
people.

Julia - The Romance Bibliophile says

What a fantastic conclusion to an amazing and entertaining series! "Cozy Christmas" was phenomenal and I
enjoyed every minute of it. Josh and Whitney were exceptional characters and I enjoyed them very much.
And I was finally able to discover out who the secret mystery benefactor was. I don't want to spoil the
surprise for anyone so you'll just have to read and see!

June says

The final Saving Main Street book was full of surprises. Josh the Cozy Cup owner and Whitney the reporter
spend time together as she tries to figure out who Mr. Moneybags us. And what a pleasant surprise!



A job well done by all 6 ladies who contributed to this continuity series!


